
What this chart shows

This shows how the UK investment trust market (excluding 3i) has moved to varying degrees of discount over the last 
20 years. By the term ‘discount’ we are referring to where the share prices are in relation to their underlying Net Asset 
Value (NAV). Clearly, certain economic and geopolitical events have had a significant influence on the sector’s valua-
tion by the market.

Share price discounts are inherently cyclical, however what we can see is that the periods of significant widening of 
discount tend to be relatively short, followed by a longer-term grind upwards with discounts narrowing closer to ‘Par’. 
However, the current period of widening the sector has experienced has been somewhat more protracted.

Why this is important

The factors that drove the sector in to the current de-rating were:

	» higher interest rates causing investors to worry about large falls in Net Asset Values as NAVs are partially pegged to 
bond yields especially in the ‘real assets’ spaces such as property and infrastructure.

	» the UK equity market being significantly out of favour with investors selling their exposure via index Exchange 
Traded Funds. As investment trusts account for c. 25% of the FTSE-350 index, outflows from the UK market create 
forced selling regardless of the price of investment trusts.

	» previously applied ‘cost disclosure’ rules placed upon investment trusts made them look more expensive than they 
actually were, therefore deterring buyers and creating forced sellers mindful of UK Consumer Duty assessments.

The confluence of those factors created a significant headwind for the sector. However, bond yields are now easing 
back; the UK equity market, partly due to its very low valuation, is attracting international money and the FCA has 
communicated forbearance on the ‘cost disclosure’ rules which will be laid down in law by the UK Treasury in its 
forthcoming Statutory Instrument on PRIIPs.

In essence therefore, the factors that got us here are now passing into the rear-view mirror. We believe that the road 
ahead presents a rare means to participate in profitable mean reversion.
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Important notes - This document is only intended for use by the original recipient, either a Momentum Global 
Investment Management Limited (MGIM) client or prospective client, and does not constitute investment advice or an 
offer or solicitation to buy or sell. This document is not intended for use or distribution by any person in any jurisdiction 
in which it is not authorised or permitted, or to anyone who would be an unlawful recipient. The original recipient is 
solely responsible for any actions in further distributing this document, and in doing so should be satisfied that there is 
no breach of local legislation or regulation. This document should not be reproduced or distributed except via original 
recipients acting as professional intermediaries. This document is not for distribution in the United States.

Prospective investors should take appropriate advice regarding applicable legal, taxation and exchange control 
regulations in countries of their citizenship, residence or domicile which may be relevant to the acquisition, holding, 
transfer, redemption or disposal of any investments herein solicited.

Any opinions expressed herein are those at the date this document is issued. Data, models and other statistics are 
sourced from our own records, unless otherwise stated. We believe that the information contained is from reliable 
sources, but we do not guarantee the relevance, accuracy or completeness thereof. Unless otherwise provided under 
UK law, MGIM does not accept liability for irrelevant, inaccurate or incomplete information contained, or for the 
correctness of opinions expressed.

The value of investments in discretionary accounts, and the income derived, may fluctuate and it is possible that an 
investor may incur losses, including a loss of the principal invested. Past performance is not generally indicative of 
future performance. Investors whose reference currency differs from that in which the underlying assets are invested 
may be subject to exchange rate movements that alter the value of their investments.

Under our multi-management arrangements, we selectively appoint underlying sub-investment managers and funds 
to actively manage underlying asset holdings in the pursuit of achieving mandated performance objectives. Annual 
investment management fees are payable both to the multimanager and the manager of the underlying assets at rates 
contained in the offering documents of the relevant portfolios (and may involve performance fees where expressly 
indicated therein).

MGIM (Company Registration No. 3733094) has its registered office at The Rex Building, 62 Queen Street, London 
EC4R 1EB. MGIM is authorised and regulated by the Financial Conduct Authority in the United Kingdom (registration 
no.232357), and is exempt from the requirements of section 7(1) of the Financial Advisory and Intermediary Services 
Act 37 of 2002 (FAIS) in South Africa, in terms of the FSCA FAIS Notice 141 of 2021 (published 15 December 2021). For 
complaints relating to MGIM’s financial services, please contact distributionservices@momentum.co.uk ©MGIM 2024.

With us, investing is personal

For more information, please contact: 

Distribution Services

E: distributionservices@momentum.co.uk

T: +44 (0)207 618 1806


